
 

CONFIDENTIAL      1 

Research Memorandum 
To:   Treasury.   

From:  Jim Reed, Resolve.   

Date:  20th May 2020. 

Ref.:  R200518 (Wave 1).   

Project ‘Safe & Sound’: JobKeeper Advertising Assessment  
 

Introduction & Methodology  

Background & Objective 

COVID-19 needs little introduction.  Since its identification in China some months ago, it has 
quickly spread to most countries, causing significant numbers of infections and, sadly, deaths.   

Thankfully, Australia is in a relative fortunate position with high levels of testing indicating a low 
and now decreasing number of cases, rare community transmission, a decent and prepared 
healthcare system, a balanced budget and relatively low debt to afford leeway to act, and a 
population relatively amenable to restrictive measures.   

This outcome has been hard-won via a series of early and decisive actions by Government, and 
following the advice of experts, such as the CMO and Treasury.  This includes the support of 
businesses, their employees and the recently unemployed, notably via the JobSeeker and 
JobKeeper programs.   

The JobKeeper program is a key plank in the Government’s plan to weather the COVID-19 
storm and to recover quickly – ‘snap back’ – as restrictions ease.  It is obviously a risk that not 
enough employers, and hence employees, successfully apply for this program in time, so it has 
become the focus of a new communications campaign.   

The assessment of these new communications materials and concepts is the aim of this study.   
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CONFIDENTIAL      1 

Research Memorandum 
To:   Treasury.   

From:  Jim Reed, Resolve.   

Date:  5th June 2020. 

Ref.:  R200518 (Wave 2).   

Project ‘Safe & Sound’: COVID Safe Territory Assessment  
 

Introduction & Methodology  

Background & Objective 

COVID-19 needs little introduction.  Since its identification in China some months ago, it quickly 
spread to most countries, causing significant numbers of infections and, sadly, deaths.   

Thankfully, Australia remains in a relative fortunate position with high levels of testing indicating 
a low and now decreasing number of cases, rare community transmission, a decent and well-
prepared healthcare system, a balanced budget and relatively low debt affording greater leeway 
to act, and a population that’s proven relatively amenable to restrictive measures.   

This outcome has been hard-won via a series of early and decisive actions by Government, and 
following the advice of experts, such as the CMO and Treasury.  This includes the support of 
businesses, their employees and the recently unemployed, notably via the JobSeeker and 
JobKeeper programs.   

But the recent announcement of a technical recession reinforces the economic effects of this 
pandemic: effects that are likely to be felt longer and, perhaps, more acutely by many than the 
health implications.  The Government is committed to getting the economy back to health as 
soon as practicable, but this must be done progressively, safely and in a reassuring manner.   

The assessment of new communications materials and concepts is the aim of this study.   

Summary Methodology 
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CONFIDENTIAL      1 

Research Memorandum 
To:   Treasury.   

From:  Jim Reed, Resolve.   

Date:  17th June 2020. 

Ref.:  R200518 (Wave 3).   

Project ‘Safe & Sound’: Economic Territory Assessment  
 

Introduction & Methodology  

Background & Objective 

COVID-19 needs little introduction.  Since its identification in China some months ago, it quickly 
spread to most countries, causing significant numbers of infections and, sadly, deaths.   

Thankfully, Australia remains in a relative fortunate position with high levels of testing indicating 
a low and now decreasing number of cases, rare community transmission, a decent and well-
prepared healthcare system, a balanced budget and relatively low debt affording greater leeway 
to act, and a population that’s proven relatively amenable to restrictive measures.   

This outcome has been hard-won via a series of early and decisive actions by Government, and 
following the advice of experts, such as the CMO and Treasury.  This includes the support of 
businesses, their employees and the recently unemployed, notably via the JobSeeker and 
JobKeeper programs.   

But the recent announcement of a technical recession reinforces the economic effects of this 
pandemic: effects that are likely to be felt longer and, perhaps, more acutely by many than the 
health implications.  The Government is committed to getting the economy back to health as 
soon as practicable, but this must be done progressively, safely and with public endorsement.   

The assessment of new communications materials and concepts is the aim of this study.   

Summary Methodology 
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CONFIDENTIAL      1 

Research Memorandum 
To:   Treasury.   

From:  Jim Reed, Resolve.   

Date:  15th June 2020. 

Ref.:  R200518 (Wave 4).   

Project ‘Safe & Sound’: JobKeeper & JobSeeker Extensions  
 

Introduction & Methodology  

Background & Objective 

COVID-19 needs little introduction.  Since its identification in China some months ago, it quickly 
spread to most countries, causing significant numbers of infections and, sadly, deaths.   

Despite Victoria’s recent outbreak, Australia still remains in a positive position overall, with 
relatively low cases and community transmission, high levels of testing indicating, a decent and 
well-prepared healthcare system, a budget and relatively low debt affording greater leeway to 
act, and a population that’s proven it can comply with restrictions.   

This outcome has been hard-won via a series of early and decisive actions by Government, and 
following the advice of experts, such as the CMO and Treasury.  This includes the support of 
businesses, their employees and the recently unemployed, notably via the JobSeeker and 
JobKeeper programs.   

These supports were always designed to be a proportional and temporary response to the 
crisis, with a review into their first three months of operation now being considered.  Given the 
evolving economic and financial situation, and a dynamic COVID-19 outbreak that may move 
beyond Victoria and its reimposed restrictions, the Government may extend them in some form.   

The assessment of communications materials to support this is the aim of this study.   
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CONFIDENTIAL     1 

Research Memorandum 
To:  Treasury.  

From: Jim Reed, Resolve.   

Date: 4th September 2020. 

Ref.: R200518 (Wave 5).   

Project ‘Safe & Sound’: JobKeeper & Coronavirus Sup. Changes 

Introduction & Methodology 

Background & Objective 

COVID-19 needs little introduction.  Since its identification in China some months ago, it quickly 
spread to most countries, causing significant numbers of infections and, sadly, deaths.   

Despite Victoria’s recent outbreak, Australia still remains in a positive position overall, with 
relatively low cases and community transmission, high levels of testing indicating, a decent and 
well-prepared healthcare system, a budget and relatively low debt affording greater leeway to 
act, and a population that’s proven it can comply with restrictions.   

This outcome has been hard-won via a series of early and decisive actions by Government, and 
following the advice of experts, such as the CMO and Treasury.  This includes the support of 
affected businesses, their employees and those on lower incomes, notably via the JobKeeper 
and Coronavirus Supplement (including JobSeeker) programs.   

These supports were always designed to be a proportional and temporary response to the 
crisis, with a review into their first three months of operation now concluded and legislation in 
place for their extension and tapered winding down.  Given the evolving economic situation and 
the very recent changes to these programs, the Government is renewing its advertising.   

The assessment of communications materials to support this is the aim of this study.  

Summary Methodology 
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